
RFB 46-07DEC21 - Janitorial Supplies - Term & Supply

Bidders: Romaine Companies Smith Paper Co. Royal Papers Interboro Packaging 
Corporation

Pyramid School Products

Bid Tabulation Hopkinsville, KY Eldon, Mo Columbia, Mo Montgomery, NY Tampa, FL

Line Item
4.10.1 De-greaser Cleaner – Quart-size spray 

bottle 
12/case

85.79$                                           28.47$                                         31.75$                                            No Bid No Bid

4.10.2 De-greaser Cleaner – Refill - Gallon 
 4 bottles per case 85.79$                                           30.27$                                         31.15$                                            No Bid No Bid

4.10.3 All-Purpose Cleaner – Quart-size Spray 
Bottle - Ready-to-Use, No Dilution 
Required
12/case

332.00$                                         28.47$                                         22.22$                                            No Bid No Bid

4.10.4 All-Purpose Cleaner – Gallon Refill - 
Ready-to-Use, No Dilution Required
4/case

No Bid 30.27$                                         27.25$                                            No Bid No Bid

4.10.5 All-Purpose Cleaner – surfactant using 
hydrogen peroxide formulated to quickly 
remove everyday soil including greasy 
residues – effectively cleans multiple 
surfaces – 1 Gallon size
4 case

75.90$                                           62.30$                                         55.80$                                            No Bid No Bid

4.10.6 Vinegar, white, minimum 5% acidity – 1 
Gallon size
4/case

No Bid 12.60$                                         9.00$                                              No Bid No Bid

4.10.7 Disinfectant Cleaner – Spray Bottle - 
Quart-size - Ready-to-Use, No Dilution 
Required
12/case

332.00$                                         35.09$                                         26.92$                                            No Bid No Bid

4.10.8 Disinfectant Cleaner – Gallon Refill - 
Ready-to-Use, No Dilution Required
4/case

No Bid 46.21$                                         40.73$                                            No Bid No Bid

4.10.9 Pine Sol, Ready-to-Use General purpose 
cleaner/disinfectant, No Dilution 
Required – Pine and Lemon Scent
144-oz. plastic bottle
3/case

66.23$                                           36.28$                                         34.95$                                            No Bid No Bid

4.10.10 Powdered Cleanser, cleans and 
deodorizes, can be used on several 
surfaces without scratching – e.g., 
porcelain, stainless steel, fiberglass, 
marble, glazed ceramic tile, etc. – Pine 
scent
21-oz. can - 24/case

82.73$                                           42.67$                                         36.25$                                            No Bid No Bid

4.10.11 Toilet Bowl Cleaner- Acid, Ready-to-Use 
Squeeze Quart Bottle, No Dilution 
Required
12/case

320.00$                                         24.88$                                         19.85$                                            No Bid No Bid

4.10.12 Toilet Bowl Cleaner- Non-Acid, Ready-to-
Use Squeeze Quart Bottle, No Dilution 
Required
12/case

320.00$                                         18.48$                                         19.95$                                            No Bid No Bid

4.10.13 Bathroom Cleaner – Spray Bottle - Quart-
size - Ready-to-Use, No Dilution Required 
– Removes touch soap scum and hard 
water stains, non-abrasive, no rinsing or 
scrubbing, EPA registered, hospital grade 
disinfectant
12/case

332.00$                                          $                                         33.13 25.82$                                            No Bid No Bid

4.10.14 Disinfectant Spray Bottle – 16.5 oz. 
aerosol spray can – quaternary spray 
disinfectant, formulated to kill cold and 
flu viruses
12 per case

300.00$                                         28.51$                                         26.70$                                            No Bid 32.79$                                         
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4.10.15 Urinal Screen - Deodorizer, VOC 
compliant, Mango Scent
12/box - 6 boxes/case

45.06$                                           18.79$                                         19.95$                                            No Bid 119.94$                                       

4.10.16 Urinal Screen - Deodorizer, VOC 
compliant, Cotton Blossom
12/box - 6 boxes/case

45.06$                                           18.77$                                         19.95$                                            No Bid 119.94$                                       

4.10.17 Urinal Mat – Disposable Deodorizer Mat, 
minimum 17.5” wide X 20.5” long, black, 
grips to floor, allows for end-user to see 
when mat needs to be replaced, clean 
scent
6/case

73.58$                                           42.73$                                         32.00$                                            No Bid 41.94$                                         

4.10.18 Furniture Cleaner – 
17 oz. aerosol spray can – Deep cleans, 
polishes wood surfaces, wax-free 
protectant – fresh lemon scent
12/case

84.27$                                           28.67$                                         34.55$                                            No Bid 35.98$                                         

4.10.19 Air Freshener – 
Minimum 15 oz. aerosol spray can – 
effectively deodorizes, eliminates 
unpleasant odors including smoke, fast-
acting and long-lasting formula – various 
scents
12/case

55.47$                                           28.67$                                         34.85$                                            No Bid 32.15$                                         

4.10.20 Air Freshener – 
Metered – minimum 5.3 oz. aerosol 
spray, must fit standard-size metered 
aerosol dispenser, effectively deodorizes, 
eliminates unpleasant odors including 
smoke, fast-acting and long-lasting 
formula – various scents
12 per case

$81.04 - $105.57 52.33$                                         31.50$                                            No Bid 32.95$                                         

4.10.21 Glass Cleaner – trigger spray bottle, quart-
size, ready-to-use, no dilution required, 
ammonia in formula, cuts through dirt, 
grease, leaves no streaks
12 per case

122.40$                                         18.74$                                         22.22$                                            No Bid No Bid

4.10.22 Glass Cleaner – Ready-to-Use CRT and 
Plexiglass cleaner – no ammonia, no 
solvent with anti-static component – for 
use on computer screens, plastic, 
stainless steel and all glass surfaces – 
quart bottle with trigger spray
12/case

104.40$                                         32.89$                                         22.35$                                            No Bid No Bid

4.10.23 Glass Cleaner – Gallon Refill ready-to-
use, no dilution required, ammonia in 
formula, cuts through dirt, grease, leaves 
no streaks
4 /per case

91.08$                                           26.83$                                         19.90$                                            No Bid No Bid

4.10.24 Trigger spray bottle, plastic, quart (32-
oz.)
12/case

13.37$                                           0.96$                                            1.20$                                              No Bid 7.08$                                           

4.10.25 Trigger spray for 32-oz. bottle with 9.88” 
tube, general purpose
24 per case

34.87$                                           0.77$                                            1.29$                                              No Bid 17.28$                                         

4.10.26 Stainless Steel Cleaner - Oil Based– 16 oz. 
aerosol can stainless steel and metal 
polish – heavy-duty cleaning agents and 
surfactants that deep-cleans stainless 
steel surfaces, removes smudges & etc. 
and polishes/restores luster with 
minimum effort
12/case

101.40$                                         45.85$                                         46.07$                                            No Bid 33.75$                                         
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4.10.27 Stainless Steel Cleaner – Water Based – 
17.5 oz. aerosol can stainless steel and 
metal polish – deep cleans and polishes, 
restores original finish with no oily 
residue, leaves protective shield
12/case

137.98$                                         43.77$                                         45.25$                                            No Bid 43.99$                                         

4.10.28 Calcium, Lime & Rust Remover 
Removes calcium and lime deposits – can 
be used on a variety of surfaces, e.g., 
stainless steel, porcelain, glass, chrome, 
fiberglass, etc. – 28 oz. bottle
12 bottles/case

186.33$                                         34.88$                                         No Bid No Bid No Bid

4.10.29 Bleach, gallon, Minimum 5% Sodium 
Hypochlorite concentration
4/ case

38.64$                                           12.72$                                         8.25$                                              No Bid No Bid

4.10.30 Carpet Stain-Remover/ Cleaner – 
Quart-size spray bottle, ready-to-use, no 
dilution required, provides on-the-spot 
cleaning spot solution pre-spray
12/case

40.29$                                           27.04$                                         22.75$                                            No Bid No Bid

4.10.31 Carpet Cleaner – 
Gallon Refill, ready-to-use, no dilution 
required, provides on-the-spot cleaning 
spot solution pre-spray
4 per case

66.80$                                           28.22$                                         24.95$                                            No Bid No Bid

4.10.32 Carpet Cleaner – 
Gallon - provides fast penetrating 
formulation that emulsifies grease, oil, 
soil – for use with extractor - Unscented
4 per case

63.77$                                           50.77$                                         29.80$                                            No Bid No Bid

4.10.33 Floor Wax – Gallon –Coverage – up to 
3,000 square feet per gallon, UL-
approved
4/case

No Bid 50.35$                                         $47.05 or $44.25 No Bid No Bid

4.10.34 Floor Stripper– Gallon - Powerful 
formulation that removes previous 
coatings of floor finish and wax – can be 
used with automatic scrubber
4 per case

No Bid 42.05$                                         35.75$                                            No Bid No Bid

4.10.35 Foam Soap – Must Fit Kutol Foam 
Dispenser #9942, 1,000 ml size, 
Sanitizing, Eco-responsible pouch
1,000 ml pouch
6 per case

No Bid 51.11$                                         $36.79 or $35.25 or $26.95 No Bid No Bid

4.10.36 Hand Soap – Liquid Antibacterial – pH 
balanced and antibacterial hand soap
Gallon Refill
4/case

No Bid 31.34$                                         33.39$                                            No Bid 47.98$                                         

4.10.37 Hand Soap – D.G.A. plus Antimicrobial 
Foam Soap – germ killing in a luxurious, 
rich soap
1,000 ml refill – 6 pouches per case

No Bid 35.19$                                         36.79$                                            No Bid No Bid

4.10.38 Trash Bags/Can Liners – Roll, Clear, Low-
Density, 7-10 Gallon, minimum .6 mil, 
Minimum Size 24”x23” or 24”X24”
20/carton – 50 cartons/case

162.62$                                         18.70$                                         31.50$                                             $37.34 or $26.84 or $24.34 
or $16.48 

No Bid

4.10.39 Trash Bags/Can Liners – Roll, Clear, High-
Density, 20-30 Gallon, minimum 10 mic, 
Minimum Size 30”X36”,
25/carton; 20 cartons per case

51.00$                                           28.04$                                         31.95$                                            $25.34 or $21.34 No Bid

4.10.40 Trash Bags/Can Liners – Roll, Black, 
Heavy Duty, 30 Gallon, minimum 1.05 
mil, 
Minimum Size 30”X33”, Tie Closure
90/carton

102.80$                                         31.27$                                         42.95$                                            19.82$                                         No Bid

4.10.41 Trash Bags/Can Liners - Outdoor – Roll, 
Black, Heavy Duty, 55 Gallon, minimum 3 
mil, 
Minimum Size 35”X56”, Tie Closure
120/carton

 No Bid 20.47$                                         32.95$                                            128.72$                                       No Bid
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4.10.42 Mop Head, Cut-End, Cotton, #16, white 
12/case 86.30$                                           4.16$                                            14.94$                                            No Bid 23.76$                                         

4.10.43 Mop, Standard Loop, - small, 5” mesh 
band, white
12/case

193.98$                                         3.95$                                            18.88$                                            No Bid 35.88$                                         

4.10.44 Mop, Rayon Wet, 24”, wide head, fantail
12/case 158.29$                                         5.98$                                            39.95$                                            No Bid 58.68$                                         

4.10.45 Broom, Angle with handle – long-lasting 
plastic fiber bristles, angle cut – head 
easily detachable for cleaning, minimum 
13” sweep
6/case

234.12$                                         6.19$                                            6.33$                                              No Bid 4.99$                                           

4.10.46 Vinyl Glove, Powder Free, Non-Medical, 
Ambidextrous, Seamless, minimum 2.0 
mil cuff thickness +/- 0.8 mil; palm 
thickness minimum 3.2 mil, +/- 0.8 mil; 
finger thickness, 3.6 mil +/- 0.8 mil; 
length 9.25” +/- 0.25” – Medium
 100 per box/ 10 boxed per case

No Bid 35.90$                                         37.50$                                            47.00$                                         59.90$                                         

4.10.47 Vinyl Glove, Powder Free, Non-Medical, 
Ambidextrous, Seamless, minimum 2.0 
mil cuff thickness +/- 0.8 mil; palm 
thickness minimum 3.2 mil, +/- 0.8 mil; 
finger thickness, 3.6 mil +/- 0.8 mil; 
length 9.25” +/- 0.25” – Large/XL
 100 per box/ 10 boxed per case

No Bid 35.90$                                         37.50$                                            47.00$                                         59.90$                                         

4.10.48 Latex (Neoprene) Glove, Flock-Lined, 
Seamless, Minimum 28 mil, 12” length – 
Medium
120 pairs/case

No Bid 1.42$                                            19.91$                                            No Bid 149.80$                                       

4.10.49 Latex (Neoprene) Glove, Flock-Lined, 
Seamless, Minimum 28 mil, 12” length – 
Large/XL
120 pairs/case

No Bid 1.57$                                            19.91$                                            No Bid 149.80$                                       

4.10.50 Jersey Knit Wrist Clute Work Gloves, 
Brown, One Size Fits Most, minimum 9-
oz per pair 
12 pairs/pack

23.97$                                           18.00$                                         7.50$                                              No Bid 9.98$                                           

4.10.51 Microfiber Cleaning Cloths, minimum 
16”X16”, general purpose cleaning, 
minimum 33 grams per cloth, can be 
extensively laundered, yellow or any 
color
12/pack  - 20 packs/case

No Bid 8.88$                                            11.25$                                            No Bid 115.20$                                       

4.10.52 Toilet Bowl Brush, Spiral, minimum 14” 
overall length, plastic fibers, round head
12/case

31.20$                                           1.56$                                            3.15$                                              No Bid 16.68$                                         

4.10.53 Toilet Paper, 2-ply, minimum sheet size 
4.25” X 3.25”, minimum 550 sheets per 
roll, soft, absorbent, 100% recycled 
content
80 rolls/case

No Bid 39.85$                                         40.95$                                            No Bid No Bid

4.10.54 Paper Towels, Kitchen, Roll, 2-ply, 
minimum 8” X 11” sheet, perforated, 
minimum 70 sheets per roll, white, 100% 
recycled content
30 rolls/case

No Bid 23.43$                                         22.00$                                            No Bid No Bid

4.10.55 Multi-fold Towels, Natural, Minimum 
9.125”X9.5” 100% recycled content
250/pack  - 16 packs/case

No Bid 16.28$                                         16.89$                                            No Bid 19.99$                                         

4.10.56 Roll Paper, minimum 8” X 800’, 2” core, 1-
ply, white
6 rolls/case

No Bid 24.78$                                         30.13$                                            No Bid 31.98$                                         
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4.10.57 Roll Paper, must minimum fit and work 
in Georgia Pacific enMotion High 
Capacity Touchless Roll Towel Dispenser 
10” X 800’, 1.75” core, Hard-wound, 
continuous sheet, white
6 rolls/case

No Bid  $64.68 - or
$48.00 

65.74$                                            No Bid No Bid

4.10.58 Roll Paper, 7.78” X 800’, 1.75” core, Hard-
wound, continuous sheet, 1-ply, brown
6 rolls/case

No Bid 20.48$                                         21.88$                                            No Bid No Bid

4.10.59 Vacuum Cleaner Bags for Windsor Sensor 
XP Vacuums
10 bags/pack - 25 packs per case

220.68$                                         26.00$                                         12.05$                                            No Bid No Bid

4.10.60 Firm, Fixed Discount off the current 
contractor catalog price or MSRP, 
whichever is less, for other janitorial 
supply items not specifically identified in 
the previous line items.

No Bid 15% 10% 50% 20%

4.10.61.1 1st Renewal Option Percentage Price 
Adjustment No Bid 4% 7% 15% 18%

4.10.61.2 2nd Renewal Option Percentage Price 
Adjustment No Bid 5% 3% 15% 18%

4.10.61.3 3rd Renewal Option Percentage Price 
Adjustment No Bid 6% 0% 15% 18%

Notes:

Freight Not Included  FOB Destination, Freight 
Prepaid and Allowed 

 FOB Destination, Freight 
Prepaid and Allowed 

 FOB Destination, Freight 
Prepaid and Allowed 

 FOB Destination, Freight 
Prepaid and Allowed 

Co-Op

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
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